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WEB REF: RL4144

ERF SIZE: 1,039m²

FLOOR SIZE: 350m²

RATES AND TAXES: R2,000

LEVIES: R1,750
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3 BEDROOM HOUSE FOR SALE IN
CARLSWALD NORTH LIFE STYLE
ESTATE 

R3,200,000

This cozy 3-bedroom house offers the perfect comfort and entertainment.
Nestled in a peaceful Carlswald North Estate

Features:

Spacious Bedrooms: The main bedroom enjoys an en-suite bathroom and
a walk-in closet. The 2nd bedroom is a shared bedroom, can be divided to
make 2 private rooms and share a bathroom

Modern Kitchen: The well-appointed kitchen boasts SMEG gas stove, ample
storage, and sleek countertops. Separate scullery with space for 3 under-
counter appliances 

Open Living Spaces: The open-concept layout seamlessly connects the
living, dining, and kitchen areas, fostering an inclusive and spacious
environment.

Natural Light: Large windows throughout the house allow natural light to
flood every corner, creating an inviting and cheerful atmosphere.

Well-Manicured Garden: Step into a botanical paradise with the beautifully
and neatly trimmed garden creating a serene atmosphere for outdoor
activities or simple relaxation.

This property offers a spacious Cottage with a kitchenette and office for
work convenience 

Parking and Security: The property offers a double automated garage plus
a driveway parking 

Location:
Carlswald North Estate offers 24-hour access controlled security and
patrols, well-maintained gardens, a clubhouse, gym, tennis courts, a
convenience shop, walking trails, kids' play area and is conveniently located
close to schools and shops with easy access to R55, N1 highway via New
Road and Olifantsfontein road

Don't miss the opportunity to experience luxury living at its finest. Contact
us today to schedule a viewing and make this exceptional house your new
home sweet home.


